
Afc vs Nfc (vsdiff.com)

AFC Category NFC

Formed in 1970 after the
NFL–AFL merger. Origin Created in 1970 to balance the

newly merged league.

16 teams divided into East,
North, South, and West
divisions.

Structure Also has 16 teams split into four
geographic divisions.

Teams like Patriots, Chiefs, and
Steelers dominate recent
decades.

Notable
Teams

Home to legendary franchises
like Cowboys, Packers, and

49ers.

AFC winner advances to the
Super Bowl as one of the league
finalists.

Super Bowl
Role

NFC winner faces the AFC
champion in the Super Bowl.

Historically strong passing
offenses and high-scoring
games.

Style of Play
Traditionally known for

dominant defenses and power
running.

Currently holds a slight edge in
overall Super Bowl wins.

Super Bowl
Wins

Close competition, with NFC
historically strong in the 80s and

90s.

Rivalries like Steelers vs Ravens,
Chiefs vs Raiders.

Iconic
Rivalries

Famous rivalries include
Cowboys vs 49ers, Packers vs

Bears.

Annual championship: AFC
Championship Game.

Conference
Title

Annual championship: NFC
Championship Game.

Produced dynasties like the New
England Patriots. Dynasties

Produced dynasties like the San
Francisco 49ers and Dallas

Cowboys.

Known for recent dominance in
the 2000s and 2010s.

Era of
Dominance

NFC was more dominant during
the 1980s and 1990s.
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